
Recommendations for the evening of September 28th 

Enjoy a beautiful evening in the lively city of Frankfurt. Use these suggestions and 
the attached map to plan your perfect evening. 

 

Traditional German cuisine 
Zum Gemalten Haus: Traditional German pub 
with nice indoor and outdoor seating and a quaint 
atmosphere. A good place to try the Frankfurt 
Green Sauce and cider. Suitable for vegetarians. 
Casual. Schweizer Strasse 67. Open: 11am-
11pm. Reservation: +49 (0)69 61 45 59. 

 
Tischlein deck dich: Small and cozy restaurant 
on the lively Berger Street. Modern cuisine with 
a wide selection for vegetarians and carnivores 
alike. Casual. Berger Straße 99. Open: 5:30 pm-
12pm. Payment is also possible with PayPal. 
Online Reservation: http://tischlein-frankfurt.de. 
 
Die Brücke: Cozy café in the old town of 
Sachsenhausen ‚Alt-Sachsenhausen‘ with 
traditional German cuisine and an international 
twist. Every week a new menu with seasonal 
specialties. Casual. Brückenstr. 19. Open: 5pm-
12pm.  Reservation: +49 (0)69 61 13 04. 

International cuisine 
VIPHO: Authentic Vietnamese restaurant near 
the Westend campus. Indoor and outdoor seating 
in a unique ambiance. Suitable for vegetarians. 
Casual. Oeder Weg 21. Open 5pm-10pm. Online 
Reservation https://vipho.de.  
 
Pizza Brudi: Traditional Naples-style pizza in 
the centre of Bockenheim. The pizzas are baked 
on stone and thus offer the rustic flair and taste of 
a Neapolitan pizza. It’s a quick in, quick out kind 
of place. Suitable for vegans. Casual. 
Leipzigerstr. 102. Open 3pm-11pm. +49 (0) 1521 
20 21 321. 
 
KISH: Oriental cuisine with traditional dishes 
from Iran. Immerse yourself in Iranian culture in 
an extraordinary ambience. Sophisticated casual. 
Leipzigerstraße 16A. Open 11:30am-11:30pm. 
Online Reservation https://kish-restaurant.de. 

 
Vegetarian focus 
Hummus Küch‘: Vegan and vegetarian 
restaurant with hummus and falafel dishes and 
modern wooden interior. Casual. Textorstraße 
38. Open 11:30am-10pm. Reservation: +49 
(0)69 62 22 99. 
 
Fine dining 
Seven Swans: Enjoy sophisticated vegan dishes 
with a view of the Main River. Stylish Michelin-
starred restaurant with minimalistic decor. All 
products are supplied by organic farms.. Mainkai 
4. Open 6:30pm-12pm. Online Reservation 
https://www.sevenswans.de/index.html. 
 
Franziska: Progressive German Vintage 
Cuisine. Located atop the Henniger Tower, 
Franziska offers a 360-degree panoramic view of 
the Frankfurt skyline and a Enjoy the chef`s table 
counter. Sophisticated chic. Hainer Weg 72. 
Open 6pm-12pm. Online Reservation 
https://www.mook-group.de/franziska/.  
 

Bars 

Yachtklub: Enjoy delicious drinks in the 
boathouse on the Main. Indoor and outdoor 
seating with a view of the skyline. Live music 
from varying styles. Entrance fee of 8€. Casual. 
Near Deutschherrnufer 12. Open 5pm-11pm. 
+49 (0) 69 34 87 13 43. 
 
YALDY: Cool bar with delicious cocktails at the 
main station district ‚Bahnhofsviertel‘. Indoor 
and outdoor seating in a modern ambiance. 
Casual. Moselstraße 15. Open 6pm-1am. +49 (0) 
69 24 00 57 16. 
 
Balthasar Ress: Wine bar and vinotheque in the 
New Old Town of Frankfurt. Enjoy your wine in 
the indoor or outdoor bar area with a view of the 
‚Römer‘, the old city hall. Sophisticated casual. 
Markt 13a. Open 3pm-10pm. +49 (0) 69 87 20 89 
56. 
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